
https://doi.org/10.46982/gjmt.2022.104 

 

Global Journal of Medical Therapeutics│www.gjmt.net                                                                           October-December 2022│ Volume 4, Issue 4 │ Pages 1-7 

  
Abstract– Background: Patients with malignancy 

undergoing chemotherapy, surgery, and radiation therapy 
experience a variety of symptoms that affect their quality  o f  
life (QoL). This necessitate the assessment of QoL on their 

subjective evidence that can be utilized in diagnosis, 
predicting prognosis, patient monitoring and clinical decision 

making. This information will help health care professionals to 
design interventions and recommend the appropriate 
treatment, thereby improving the QoL of patients. In this study 

we aim to assess the QoL of patients receiving a djuvant  and 
neo-adjuvant therapy for Lung, Breast, and Colorectal cancer, 
in addition to making correlations according to type of 

treatment and disease stage. Methods: A prospective 
observational study was carried out in the radiation oncology 

department from March 2021 to September 2021 in  Krishna  
Rajendra Hospital, Mysuru, India. We used the European 
Organization for Research and Treatment of Cancer quality of 

questionnaire [EORTC QLQ – C30] Version 3.0 to assess the 
QoL of patients. Patients were interviewed twice, when they 
came to have their chemotherapy regardless of the cycle 

number and during the next visit. Results: The number of 
patients enrolled in the study were 107. Most of part icipants 

were female 83%. About 73.8% diagnosed with breast cancer. 
In patients treated with adjuvant versus neo-adjuvant 
treatment, the functional scores and global health status scores 

were statistically significant p=0.038 and p=0.010 respectively 
with mean scores 63.54 in favour of adjuvant therapy. These 
results represent a better QoL in patients received a djuvant 

versus neo-adjuvant therapy. The mean values of global health  
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status score in patients diagnosed with lung cancer during the 

two assessments (47.72, 51.51) were lesser than those in 
patients diagnosed with breast cancer (63.71,63.50) and 
colorectal cancer (58.82,58.82), indicating patients with  lung 

cancer had poor QoL compared to breast and colorectal cancer  
patients. Conclusion: Patients received adjuvant therapy had 

better QoL compared to those received neo-adjuvant therapy . 
The QoL in lung cancer patients were majorly affected as 
compared to QoL in breast and colorectal cancer patients. 

There is a strong correlation between the type of treatment and 
disease stage.  

 

Keywords: Malignancy; Quality of life (QoL);  Adjuvant  
therapy; Neo-adjuvant therapy; Chemotherapy; EORTC QLQ 
– C30. 

1. INTRODUCTION 

ancer is the second leading cause of death worldwide [1 ]. 

Cancer can be treated by different modalit ies including 
surgery, radiation therapy, chemotherapy, 

immunotherapy, targeted therapy, hormone replacement 

therapy, and stem cell transplantation. Treatment options will 
vary depending on the sort of cancer and how far it has 
progressed. Some cancer patients will just require one 

treatment. Most patients, on the other hand, receive a 
combination of therapies, such as surgery combined with 

chemotherapy and/or radiation therapy [2]. 
Chemotherapy has significant short- and long-term adverse 

effects. The specific drugs employed in the treatment regimen, 

as well as the dose and length of treatment, all in f luence the 
side effects [3]. Chemotherapy can cause nausea, vomit ing, 
hair loss, cognitive dysfunction, fatigue, changes in sexual 

function, and a decrease in Quality of life (QoL). One-third o f 
patients undergoing systemic chemotherapy experience 

cognitive dysfunction that negatively impacts their QoL [4].  
Neo-adjuvant therapy refers to treatments given before the 

primary cancer treatment, whereas adjuvant therapy ref ers t o  

treatments given after the primary treatment. The general goal 
of these multimodal treatment techniques is to  im prove the 
efficacy of local definitive therapy while reducing the negative 
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effects that patients may suffer during primary therapies. Th is 
method is most commonly employed in patients with  b reast , 

colon, or lung malignancies to boost the chances of targeting 
all cancer cells [5]. 

According to the World Health Organization, health-related 

quality of life (HRQoL) is a multi-dimensional term that 
includes domains such as physical, mental, em otional, a nd 

social functioning [6]. It is the overall being of an ind ividual 
in terms of social, physical, mental, and emotional aspects o f  
life. It is difficult to describe and quantify the QoL. The best 

way to explain and quantify the QoL is to use words 
individually, depending on one's current lifestyle, past 
knowledge, future expectations, desires, and aspirations [7 ]. 

Medical advancements and the growth of evidence-based 
medicine (EBM) have resulted in significant improvements in  

both survival and treatment quality in the field  o f  oncology.   
Exploring the QoL of cancer patients often  necessitates an  
interest in their daily lives and a direct emphasis on their 

perspectives, which necessitates considering the QoL 
differently, based on the subjective experience of the patient’s 
everyday lives, which we prefer to call the quality of daily life 

[8]. The wide applicability of QoL assessments includes 
diagnosis, predicting prognosis, evaluation, patient 

monitoring, clinical decision making, communication, and 
treatment along with designing system intervention, allocating 
resources and research efforts, training health care personnel, 

and reducing costs [9]. In this study we aim to assess the QoL 
of the patient receiving adjuvant and neo-adjuvant therapy f or 
Lung, Breast, and Colorectal malignancies. I n  addit ion to  

making correlations between QoL and disease stage and type 
of treatment as well as to find out the commonest 

malignancies which majorly affect the QoL of cancer 
patients. 

2. MATERIALS AND METHODS 

A prospective observational study was carried  out  in  the 
radiation oncology department, Krishna Rajendra Hospital, 
Mysuru, India for a period of six months from March 2021 to 

September 2021. The study was approved by the Institutional 
Ethical Committee, Mysore Medical College and Research  

Institute, Mysuru. All patients ≥ 18 years of both genders and 
patients diagnosed with lung, breast, and colorectal cancer 
who are on adjuvant or neo-adjuvant therapy were invited to 

participate in the study, while patients who were not willing to  
participate and patients with incomplete medical or medication 
information were excluded. The patients were enro lled  a fter 

obtaining the informed consent form which was prepared both 
in English and the local language i.e. Kannada.  

All relevant data of the enrolled patients was documented in 
a designed data collection form. We used the European 
Organization for Research and Treatment of Cancer quality of 

questionnaire [EORTC QLQ – C30] Version 3.0 to assess the 
QoL.  EORTC QLQ – C30 is a valid and reliable tool that 
contains a 30- item cancer- specific core questionnaire that 

addresses various domains including functional scale 
(physical, cognitive, role, emotional, and social), symptom 

scale (fatigue, pain and nausea/vomiting) a nd global health 
status scale (overall QoL) [10]. The questionnaire wa s given 
to the patients twice (irrespective of cycle number) by 

interviewing them i.e. first when they came to receive their 

chemotherapy cycle and second assessment wa s done when 
they came to receive their next chemotherapy cycle.  

The higher scores in global health status the better QoL. 
Similarly, higher scores in functional scales indicate better 
QoL. On the other hand, higher scores in symptoms scales 

means the worser the QoL. For functional scales, subjects 
scoring <33.3% have problem, those scoring ≥ 66 .7% have 

good functioning. For symptoms scales, subject scoring < 
33.3% have good QoL and those scoring ≥ 66.7% have 
problems [10]. Statistical analysis was done using ANOVA 

test and IBM SPSS Version 22 software. A p-value of ≤ 0 .05  
was considered as a significant value. 

3. RESULTS 

We enrolled 107 subjects. Out of 107 patients, 16.82% were 
men and 83.17% were women in which 74.76% patients 

received adjuvant therapy while 25.23% patients received neo-
adjuvant therapy. Majority of patients received chemotherapy  
96% through the intravenous route which was followed by 

surgery 63.6%, radiation therapy 0.95%, and concomitant 
therapy 2.8%. The details of patient demographics are 
presented in Table 1.  

Most patients diagnosed with breast cancer. The prevalence 
of cancer type among the patients in our study is presented  in  

Figure 1. Majority of patients were diagnosed with  Stage I V 
cancer. 
 

Table 1. Patient's demographics  

 
 
 

 
 

     Figure 1. Types of cancer among participants 
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CHARACTERISTICS 

NUMBER OF  

SUBJECTS (n) 

PERCENTAGE  

(%) 

Total number of patients 107 100 

Age distribution (in years) 

 25-40 
 41-55 

 56-70 
 71-85 

 

18 
46 

37 
6 

 

16.8 
43 

34.6 
5.6 

Gender distribution 
 Men  

 Women  

 
18 

89 

 
16.8 

83.2 

Stages 
 I 
 II 

 III 
 IV 

 
3 
25 

33 
46 

 
2.8 
23.4 

30.8 
43 
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Table 2. Correlations between types of therapy & QoL domains 

 

Table 3. Correlation between types of therapy & detailed QoL domains  
 

AT: Adjuvant therapy, NAT: Neo-adjuvant therapy, * statistically significant 
 

The mean values of functional scale scores and global health 

status scale scores in patients received adjuvant therapy were 
greater than patients who received neo -ad juvant  therapy in  
both the first response and second response. This indicate 

better QoL in patients who received adjuvant treatment versus 
those who had neo-adjuvant therapy. The symptom scale 

scores in patients received adjuvant therapy were lesser than in 
patients received neo-adjuvant therapy in  bo th  the f irst  a nd 
second response indicating better QoL in patients received 

adjuvant treatment. These results confirmed with  the second 
assessment of functional scale scores (p=0.038) a nd the f irst  
assessment of global health status scale scores (p=0.010). 

Under the symptom scale, symptoms such a s constipat ion, 
diarrhea and dyspnea scores were low and p value were 

significant (p=0.024, p=0.002, p=0.002) respectively. Under  

 
the functional scale, physical function score was significant  in  

the first and second assessment, p=0.012, p=0.010) 
respectively.  The details of the QoL assessment o f d if ferent 
domains scores and correlation with the type o f therapy  are  

presented in Table 2 and Table 3. 
The mean values of the global health status score in  lung 

cancer patients (47.72, 51.51) were lesser than in Breast cancer 
patients (63.71, 63.50) and colorectal cancer patients (58 .82 , 
58.82). Similarly, the mean values of functional scale score in  

lung cancer patients (56.16, 56.27) were lesser than  in  b reast 
cancer patients (69.78,70.82) and colorectal cancer patients 
(62.74,64.45), whereas the mean values of the symptom scale 

scores in lung cancer patients (38.92, 33.60) was greater than 
in breast cancer patients (25.86, 22.90) and colorectal ca ncer 

patients (28.80, 30.01), indicating that patients with lung 

Domain First Assessment P-value Second Assessment  P-value 

   Functional Scale 

Physical function       AT 

                                NAT 

2.483 

2.888 

0.012* 2.321 

2.827 

0.010* 

Role function             AT 
                                NAT 

1.637 
1.836 

0.298 1.500 
1.844 

0.081 

Emotional function    AT 

                                NAT 

2.072 

2.101 

0.707 2.015 

2.175 

0.494 

Cognitive function     AT 
                                NAT 

1.213 
1.407 

0.092 1.188 
1.333 

0.239 

Social function          AT  
                                NAT                  

1.975 
1.982 

0.797 2.243 
2.444 

0.490 

  Symptom Scale 

Fatigue                       AT                                                             

                                NAT 

2.075 

1.852 

0.279 1.813 

1.926 

0.591 

Nausea                       AT 
                                NAT 

.400 
1.481 

0.623 1.387 
1.296 

0.585 

Vomiting                    AT 
                                NAT 

1.188 
1.407 

0.089 1.225 
1.259 

0.811 

Pain                            AT 

                                NAT 

2.213 

2.487 

0.232 2.000 

2.296 

0.187 

Dyspnea                     AT 
                                NAT 

1.150 
1.593 

0.002* 1.125 
1.296 

0.084 

Insomnia                    AT 

                                NAT 

2.063 

2.000 

0.810 2.012 

2.074 

0.827 

Appetite loss              AT 

                                NAT 

1.850 

1.815 

0.868 1.713 

2.037 

0.167 

Constipation              AT 
                                NAT 

1.213 
1.296 

0.538 1.137 
1.444 

0.024* 

Diarrhea                     AT 

                                NAT 

1.225 

1.296 

0.583 1.037 

1.333 

0.002* 

Financial Difficulties AT 
                                 NAT 

2.663 
2.563 

0.783 3.013 
3.185 

0.499 

Type of therapy Functional scale 
score 1 

Functional scale  
score 2 

Symptom 
scale score 1 

Symptom scale 
Score 2 

Global Health 
Status scale score 1 

Global Health Statu s  
scale score 2 

Adjuvant 
 Mean 

 N 
 Std. Deviation 

 
68.69 

80 
17.22 

 
70.77 

80 
19.45 

 
26.82 

80 
15.35 

 
23.35 

80 
19.54 

 
63.54 

80 
14.24 

 
62.60 

80 
15.00 

 Neo-adjuvant  

  Mean 
  N 

  Std. Deviation 

 

63.04 
27 

15.82 

 

61.01 
27 

24.60 

 

30.19 
27 

19.55 

 

30.39 
27 

18.50 

 

54.62 
27 

18.10 

 

58.33 
27 

23.68 

 Sig. (p-value) 1.36 0.038 0.360 0.104 0.010 0.277 
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cancer had poor QoL compared to breast and colorectal cancer 
patients. The first assessment of functional scale scores 

(p=0.020), the first assessment of Symptom scale score 
(p=0.045), and the first assessment for global health status 
scale scores (p=0.004) indicating the significance correlat ion  

between type of cancer and QoL. Patients with lung cancer had 
the least QoL (Table 3). Under the symptom scale, symptoms 

 
 

such as constipation, and diarrhea, were found to be correlated  
with QoL and were statistically significant for the second 

assessment whereas dyspnea was found to be sign if ican t f o r 
both the first and second assessments. In the functional scale, 
physical function and cognitive functions were f ound  to be 

significant but only for the first assessment. The details are 
presented in Table 4, Table 5 and Table 6  

 
 

Table 4. Correlations between types of cancer & QoL domains' scores 

  
 
Table 5. Correlations between types of cancer & domains  

 

 
 

 

 
Type of cancer 

 
Functional scale 

 score 1 

 
Functional 

scale score 2 

 
Symptom scale 

score 1  

 
Symptom scale 

Score 2 

 
Global Health 

Status scale score 1 

 
Global Health Status 

scale score 2 
  

Breast  
Mean 

N  
Std. Deviation  

 
69.78 

79 
16.39 

 
70.82 

79 
18.69 

 
25.86 

79 
15.45 

 
22.90 

79 
18.37 

 
63.71 

79 
14.68 

 
63.50 

79 
16.02 

 

Colorectal  
Mean 

N 
Std. Deviation 

 
62.74 

17 
16.75 

 
64.45 

17 
25.01 

 
28.80 

17 
14.40 

 
30.01 

17 
21.74 

 
58.82 

17 
15.15 

 
58.82 

17 
17.54 

 

Lung  
Mean  

N 
Std. Deviation 

 
56.16 

11 
17.12 

 
56.27 

11 
28.16 

 
38.92 

11 
22.75 

 
33.60 

11 
21.37 

 
47.72 

11 
17.51 

 
51.51 

11 
24.94 

 

Sig. (p-value) 0.020 0.072 0.045 0.122 0.004 0.082 
  

Mean values Breast Cancer 
 

Lung cancer              Colorectal cancer 
 

Domain     First  

Assessment 

 Second 

Assessment 

First  

assessment 

 Second 

Assessment 

First  

assessment  

Second 

Assessment 
  

                                                                              

Functional scale  
  
Physical function 2.409 2.341 3.393 3.000 3.042 2.588 

Role function 1.607 1.470 1.909 1.981 1.848 1.755 

Emotional function 2.834 2.015 2.272 2.295 2.132 2.052 

Cognitive function 1.203 1.177 1.818 1.545 1.132 1.148 

Social function 1.993 1.285 2.045 2.545 2.044 2.269 

                                                                      
 Symptom scale 

  
Fatigue 2.000 1.810 2.000 2.364 2.148 1.439 

Nausea 1.456 1.392 1.455 1.182 1.169 1.222 

Vomiting 1.190 1.203 1.636 1.273 1.169 1.233 

Pain 2.177 1.962 3.000 2.818 2.227 1.788 

Dyspnea 1.165 1.101 2.091 1.636 1.121 1.121 

Insomnia 2.051 2.013 2.273 2.364 2.190 1.883 

Appetite loss 1.797 1.646 1.909 2.182 1.714 1.862 

Constipation 1.190 1.114 1.273 1.273 1.301 1.449 

Diarrhea 1.190 1.051 1.545 1.545 1.227 1.074 

Financial Difficulties 2.557 2.975 3.000 3.455 2.592 3.132 
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Table 6. Correlations between types of cancer & domains 
scores 

* Statistically significant 
 

Comparing QoL in patients diagnosed with stage IV cancer 
to earlier stages, the mean values on symptom measures had 

significant correlation with QoL p=0.05. Patients with  stage 
IV cancer had mean values on the global health status scale 
that were lower than those with the earlier stages. This 

demonstrates that patients who were diagnosed with  a  Stage 
IV cancer had lower quality of life. The correlation between  
QoL and stages of cancer is presented in Table 7.  

4. DISCUSSION 

In this study, we have assessed the QoL of patients 

receiving adjuvant and neo-adjuvant therapy.  Our study 
findings depicted that the patients on a djuvant therapy had 
better QoL than the patients on neo-adjuvant  therapy. Th is 

might be explained as patients undergoing adjuvant  therapy 
already being adapted to the drugs and their side ef f ects, o r 
because they may have psychologically adjusted to the 

treatment, medications, etc., leading to better QoL. 
The prevalence of breast cancer was more than that  o f lun g 

cancer and colorectal cancer as most of patients enrolled in the  
study were female 83.17%. Different aspects, such as social  
history, lifestyles, familial history, or genetic predispositions, 

may contribute to the prevalence of specific cancer types. 
About 42.99% of participants had a stage IV cancer, whereas 
just 2.80% had a stage I. This could be a factor in f luencing 

QoL because early discovery and diagnosis aid in early  
treatment, which improves patients' QoL. 

Breast cancer:  the mean age of patients included in our 
study was 52.96±11.99 which is consistent with the study 
conducted by Deshpande VP, et al. as they included  patients 

with a mean age of 51.35±12.14 [11]. The Global health status 
scale in our study was statistically significant which was 
similar to a study conducted by So WKW, Marsh G, Ling 

WM, Leung FY, Lo JCK, Yeung M, et al. in which the overall 
QoL was statistically significant [12]. Wani SQ, et al. 
conducted a study in which the mean value of insomnia, loss 

of appetite, nausea, and vomiting in the symptoms scale 
improved over time and the global health status scale was 

statistically significant and correlated with type of cancer [13]. 
These findings were in consistent to the results of our study. 

Colorectal cancer: our study population had the highest 
mean scores to financial problems, followed by symptoms as 
fatigue, pain, insomnia, constipation, appetite loss, nausea and 

vomiting, diarrhea, and dyspnea. These results were 
comparable to the study conducted by Laghousi D, et al. [14].  

Lung cancer: dyspnea was shown to be statistically 
significant on the symptom scale assessment. These f ind ings 
were in accordance with the study conducted by Kenny PM, et 

al. [15]. The mean value of dyspnea in the symptoms scale 
were improved from the first assessment (19) to  the second 
assessment (12) in a study conducted by Gralla RJ, et al. [16] 

which was consistent to our study results in  which  dyspnea 
were improved from 2.091 to 1.636. In another study by 

Barwal V, et al. the patient's overall health condition remained 
essentially the same, and the mean scores for the em otional, 
role and social functioning did not significantly alter at the 

follow-up. Constipation, sleep, and fatigue were still 
statistically significant [17]. These results were compatible 
with our results. The cause might be explained as patients 

were receiving treatment, which might have stopped these 
symptoms from getting worse. 

Adjuvant therapy: dyspnea and constipation were shown to  
be statistically significant symptoms in research done by 
Nicolussi AC and Sawada NO in individuals undergoing 

adjuvant therapy [18]. This result was comparable to our 
investigation. Our findings are consistent with those of a study 
by Park S, Kim IR et al. in which sleep disturbance, a ppet ite 

loss, and constipation were found to be statistically significant 
[19]. 

Adjuvant and neo-adjuvant therapy: according to research 
done by Arraras JI, Suárez J, et al. as a whole, the sample 's 
QoL scores on the EORTC questionnaires were quite high, 

and only minimal changes were found for global QoL, 
insomnia, and constipation [20]. This was comparable to what 
we found in our investigation. 

Strengths and limitations: Strengths of our study include 
evaluation of three different types (Breast, Lung, and 

Colorectal) of Cancer patients, health-related quality  o f  lif e 
was measured using an open-ended questionnaire of EORTC-
QLQ- C30 version 3.0 and QoL was compared according to  

the disease stages and type of treatment. Limitations include, 
enrolling limited number of patients. It was based on a single 
site study, so the results cannot be extrapolated with the 

multiple site study and imposition of lockdown due to 
COVID-19 pandemic during the study.  

5. CONCLUSION & FUTURE DIRECTIONS 

Patient receiving adjuvant therapy had better QoL compared 
to those who had neo-adjuvant therapy. The QoL in Lung 

cancer patients was the least compared to that  in  b reast  and  
colorectal cancer patients. There is a strong correlation 
between type of cancer, type of treatment, stage of disease and 

patients QOL. Thus, there is a need to enhance the QoL which 
can be achieved by undertaking the following measures:   

i) Educating health care professionals rega rding the QoL 
measures to be taken during management.  

                                                  
 

 
Breast Cancer, Lung cancer, and Colorectal  
cancer 

Domain First 

assessment  

Second assessment 

                            Functional scale  
Physical function 0.034* 0.148 

Role function 0.195 0.108 

Emotional function 0.673 0.703 

Cognitive function 0.004* 0.135 

Social function 0.734 0.679 

                              Symptom scale 

Fatigue 0.019* 0.230 

Nausea 0.849 0.388 

Vomiting 0.203 0.600 

Pain 0.116 0.076 

Dyspnea 0.000* 0.005* 

Insomnia 0.692 0.632 

Appetite loss 0.744 0.095 

Constipation 0.564 0.013* 

Diarrhea 0.161 0.008* 

Financial difficulties 0.620 0.733 
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Table 7. Correlations between stage of disease & QoL 
domains scores 

 

ii) Educating and counselling patients regarding the disease 
and treatment side effects in order to make them 
physically, mentally, and psychologically accept the 
situation and cope-up with therapy. 

iii) Encouraging patients to promptly disclose the discomfort  
faced during the therapy journey. 

iv) Advising non-pharmacological interventions to enhance 
QoL and recruiting experienced health care professionals 
in order to provide the best patient care.     

 

Conflict of interest statement: The authors declare that  the 
research was conducted without any commercial or financial 

relationships that can be of any potential conflict of interest. 
 

Author contributions: Conceptualization: PLN, ABJ (bo th  

authors have equal contribution); Study design : PLN, ABJ, 
MS, NMS, BPL; Literature search: PLZ, ABJ, CS, MA; Data 
acquisition and clinical study: ABJ; PLN; Data analysis: 

ABJ; Manuscript drafting and editing: PLN; Manuscript 
review: PLN, ABJ, MS, NMS, BPL. All authors reviewed the 

manuscript, discussed the results, and contributed to the final 
manuscript. 
 

Funding: No funding sources. 
 

Acknowledgement: It is a  genuine pleasure to express our 
sincere thanks and gratitude to Dr. Prashanth B for providing 
comprehensive statistical advice. We owe a  deep  sense o f 

gratitude to Dr. S B Nikitha and Dr. Abhishek Krishna for 
their support and guidance throughout the study. We whole 

heartedly remember the help and support provided  by Dr.K 
Hanumanthachar Joshi, Dr. Davan B Bevoor, Mr.Charan CS 
and our beloved lecturers. Their scholarly advice, meticulous 

scrutiny, and suggestions enabled us to complete our 
dissertation work.  

We are extremely thankful to the health care professionals 

of KR Hospital, Mysuru, and our special thanks to  a ll our 
friends who directly or indirectly have helped us in the 

completion of our dissertation work. 

REFERENCES: 

1. Sung H, Ferlay J, Siegel RL, Laversanne M, 

Soerjomataram I, Jemal A, et al. Global cancer 
STATISTICS 2020: GLOBOCAN estimates of 
incidence and Mortality Worldwide for 36 cancers in 

185 COUNTRIES. CA: A Cancer Journal for Clinicians.  
 

 
 

 

2021;71(3):209–49. DOI: 
https://doi.org/10.3322/caac.21660                                            

2. Types of Cancer Treatment. 2017. Accessed 2021 Ju l 9 . 

https://www.cancer.gov/about-cancer/ treatment/ types              
3. Partridge AH, Burstein HJ, Winer EP. Side ef f ects o f  

chemotherapy and combined chemohormonal therapy in  
women with early-stage breast cancer. JNCI Monographs. 
2001;2001(30):135–42. DOI: 

doi.org/10.1093/oxfordjournals.jncimonographs.a003451  
4. Kayl AE, Meyers CA. Side-effects of chemotherapy a nd 

quality of life in ovarian and breast cancer patients. 

Current Opinion in Obstetrics and Gynecology. 
2006;18(1):24–8. DOI: 

https://doi.org/10.1097/01.gco.0000192996.20040.24     
5. Neoadjuvant vs. Adjuvant therapy: What is the difference? 

[Internet]. Healio.com. Accessed on 2021 Jul 9. 

https://www.healio.com/news/hematology-
oncology/20150921/neoadjuvant-vs-adjuvan t-therapy -
what-is-the-difference 

6. Health-related quality of life and well-being [Internet]. 
Healthypeople.gov. Accessed 2021, Jul 9  

https://www.healthypeople.gov/2020/about /foundation-
health measures/Health-Related-Quality-of-Life-and-Well-
Being                                                       

7. Calman KC. Quality of life in cancer patients--an 
hypothesis. Journal of Medical Ethics. 1984;10(3):124–7.  
DOI: https://doi.org/10.1136/jme.10.3.124                                                 

8. Sibeoni J, Picard C, Orri M, Labey M, Bousquet G, 
Verneuil L, et al. Patients’ quality of life during active 

cancer treatment: a  qualitative study. BMC Cancer. 
2018;18(1):951.   DOI: https://doi.org/10.1186/s12885-
018-4868-6 

9. Perry S, Kowalski TL, Chang C-H. Quality of life 
assessment in women with breast cancer: benefits, 
acceptability and utilization. Health and Quality of  Lif e 

Outcomes. 2007;5(1):24. DOI: DOI: 
https://doi.org/10.1186/1477-7525-5-24 

10. European Organization for Research and Treatment o f  
Cancer quality Accessed 2021 Jul 9. 
https://www.eortc.org/app/uploads/sites/2/2018/02/SCm

anual.pdf 
11.  Deshpande VP, Shinde RK, Deo D, Hippargekar P, 

Venurkar SV. Assessment of quality of life in patients of 

mastectomy with chemotherapy. 
Cureus.2022;14(8):e27703. DOI:10.7759/cureus.27703                                                  

12.  So WKW, Marsh G, Ling WM, Leung FY, Lo JCK, 
Yeung M, et al. Anxiety, depression and quality of life 

Stages Functional 
Score 1 

Functional 
Score 2 

Symptom 
Score 1 

Symptom 
Score 2 

Global Health 
Status Score 1 

Global Health 
Status Score 2 

Stage I         Mean     

                    SD                                                 

57.03 

15.76 

56.44 

26.38 

37.60 

11.56 

16.11 

19.42 

52.77 

4.81 

61.11 

14.73 

Stage II       Mean 
                    SD 

63.73 
18.10 

67.84 
18.38 

30.46 
15.65 

24.06 
19.50 

60.33 
16.36 

60.66 
16.72 

Stage III      Mean 
                    SD 

74.27 
17.92 

75.73 
15.01 

19.65 
11.60 

23.17 
18.30 

65.15 
15.65 

64.14 
19.71 

Stage IV     Mean 

                   SD 

64.83 

16.99 

64.02 

24.83 

31.27 

18.34 

27.71 

20.41 

59.60 

15.61 

60.14 

17.57 

P - value 0.19 0.08 0.05* 0.40 0.34 0.77 

http://www.gjmt.net/
https://doi.org/10.3322/caac.21660
https://www.cancer.gov/about-cancer/treatment/types
https://doi.org/10.1093/oxfordjournals.jncimonographs.a003451
https://doi.org/10.1097/01.gco.0000192996.20040.24
https://www.healio.com/news/hematology-oncology/20150921/neoadjuvant-vs-adjuvant-therapy-what-is-the-difference
https://www.healio.com/news/hematology-oncology/20150921/neoadjuvant-vs-adjuvant-therapy-what-is-the-difference
https://www.healio.com/news/hematology-oncology/20150921/neoadjuvant-vs-adjuvant-therapy-what-is-the-difference
https://www.healthypeople.gov/2020/about/foundation-health%20measures/Health-Related-Quality-of-Life-and-Well-Being
https://www.healthypeople.gov/2020/about/foundation-health%20measures/Health-Related-Quality-of-Life-and-Well-Being
https://www.healthypeople.gov/2020/about/foundation-health%20measures/Health-Related-Quality-of-Life-and-Well-Being
https://doi.org/10.1136/jme.10.3.124
doi:%20https://doi.org/10.1186/s12885-018-4868-6
doi:%20https://doi.org/10.1186/s12885-018-4868-6
https://doi.org/10.1186/1477-7525-5-24
https://www.eortc.org/app/uploads/sites/2/2018/02/SCmanual.pdf
https://www.eortc.org/app/uploads/sites/2/2018/02/SCmanual.pdf
https://doi.org/10.7759%2Fcureus.27703


7                                                                                                                                                                                                                                  Prashanth et al. 
 

Global Journal of Medical Therapeutics│www.gjmt.net                                                                           October-December 2021│ Volume 4, Issue 4 │ Pages 1-7 

among Chinese breast cancer patients during adjuvant 
therapy. European Journal of Oncology Nursing. 

2010;14(1):17–22. 
DOI:https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ejon.2009.07.005                                                                                   

13. Wani SQ, Khan T, Teeli AM, Khan NA, Wani SY, 

Ashfaq-ul-Hassan. Quality of life assessment in 
survivors of breast cancer. J Cancer Res Ther [Internet]. 

2012;8(2):272–6. DOI: 10.4103/0973-1482.98986 
14. Laghousi D, Jafari E, Nikbakht H, Nasiri B, 

Shamshirgaran M, Aminisani N. Gender differences in  

health-related quality of life among patients with 
colorectal cancer. J Gastrointest Oncol. 2019;10(3):453–
61. DOI: 10.21037/jgo.2019.02.04 

15. Kenny PM, King MT, Viney RC, Boyer MJ, Pollicino 
CA, McLean JM, et al. Quality of life and survival in the 

2 years after surgery for non small-cell lung cancer. J 
Clin Oncol. 2008;26(2):233–41. 
DOI: 10.1200/JCO.2006.07.7230 

16. Gralla RJ, Edelman MJ, Detterbeck FC, Jahan TM, 
Loesch DM, Limentani SA, et al. Assessing quality of 
life following neoadjuvant therapy for early stage non -

small cell lung cancer (NSCLC): results from a 
prospective analysis using the Lung Cancer Sym ptom 

Scale (LCSS). Support Care Cancer.2009;17(3):307–13. 
DOI: 10.1007/s00520-008-0489-y 

17. Barwal V, Mazta S, Thakur A, Seam R, Gupta M. Quality 

of life among lung cancer patients undergoing treatment  
at a  tertiary cancer institute in North India. International 
Journal of Research in Medical Sciences. 2016;4903–10. 

DOI: 10.18203/2320-6012.ijrms20163789 
18. Nicolussi AC, Sawada NO. Qualidade de vida de 

pacientes com câncer colorectal em terapia ad juvante. 
Acta Paul Enferm. 2009;22(2):155–61.  
DOI: 10.1590/S0103-21002009000200007 

19. Park S, Kim IR, Baek KK, Lee SJ, Chang WJ, Maeng 
CH, et al. Prospective analysis of quality of life in 
elderly patients treated with adjuvant chemotherapy f o r 

non-small-cell lung cancer. Ann Oncol. 
2013;24(6):1630–9. DOI: 10.1093/annonc/mds649 

20. Arraras JI, Suárez J, Arias-de-la-Vega F, Vera R, Ibáñez 
B, Asin G, et al. Quality of life assessment by a pply ing 
EORTC questionnaires to rectal cancer patients after 

surgery and neoadjuvant and adjuvan t t reatment . Rev 
Esp Enferm Dig.2013;105(5):255–61.  
DOI:10.4321/s1130-01082013000500003 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 
 

http://www.gjmt.net/
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ejon.2009.07.005
https://doi.org/10.4103/0973-1482.98986
https://doi.org/10.21037%2Fjgo.2019.02.04
https://doi.org/10.1200/jco.2006.07.7230
https://doi.org/10.1007/s00520-008-0489-y
http://dx.doi.org/10.18203/2320-6012.ijrms20163789
https://doi.org/10.1093/annonc/mds649
https://doi.org/10.4321/s1130-01082013000500003

